INVITATION FOR BID (IFB) #044-24
ROAD MATERIAL PROVIDERS

AC CONCRETE & DENVER INDUSTRIAL SALES & GREEN DREAM SITEONE LANDSCAPE
BIDDERS MATERIALS BRANNAN SAND & GRAVEL CRAFCO, INC. SERVICE CO. INTERNATIONAL LLC HOLCIM SUPPLY
COMPANY CONTACT JUSTIN CLARE RACHEL HENDRICKSON GAIL GAUTIER TODD MELLEMA VARAND VARTANIAN NIC HARTMAN KEITH MCGINTY
COMPANY TELEPHONE NUMBER 719-748-3805 303-853-1231 602-276-0406 303-935-2485 814-840-1880 303-716-5200 216-706-9250
CONTACT EMAIL ADDRESS ACConcrete@USA.net rhendrickson@brannanl.com bids@crafco.com todd@dissco.net info@gdicompany.com nic.hartman@holcim.com bids@SiteOne.com
SECTION ONE: AGGREGATE BASE
COURSE
15,000 tons (approximate) Class 6, Aggregate Base Course
Class 6 Cost Per Ton
FOB: Castle Rock $9.50 $31.40 + FSC NO BID NO BID $28.66 $16.65 $30.50
FOB: Parker $9.50 $31.00 + FSC NO BID NO BID $31.20 $16.95 $30.50
FOB: Southeast Facility $9.50 $33.55 +FSC NO BID NO BID $31.95 $21.90 $37.50
FOB: Waterton Yard $9.50 $31.25 +FSC NO BID NO BID $30.76 $14.85 $29.75
FOB: Larkspur Yard $9.50 $32.40 + FSC NO BID NO BID $29.51 $19.95 $35.50
FOB: Vendors Plant $9.50 $21.00 NO BID NO BID $18.53 $10.75 NO BID

57,000 tons (approximate) Class 5, (Special) Aggregate Base Course
Class 5 (Special) Cost per Ton

FOB: Castle Rock $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.18 $16.90 $34.75
FOB: Parker $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.72 $17.20 $38.95
FOB: Southeast Facility $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.46 $22.15 $35.85
FOB: Waterton Yard $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.28 $15.10 $40.50
FOB: Larkspur Yard $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.03 $20.20 $35.50
FOB: Vendors Plant $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.04 $11.00 NO BID

Cost per Ton ~ Per Mile Delivered to Project Site

from Plant

FOB: Castle Rock $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID . Class 6 $15.40 / Class 5 $18.20
FOB: Parker $36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.25 per ton mile for local Class 6 $15.40 / Class 5 $21.00
FOB: Southeast Facility $36.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID non-mountain deliveries Class 6 $16.80 / Class 5 $16.80
FOB: Waterton Yard $36.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5030 per ton mile for Class 6 $12.60 / Class 5 $22.40
FOB: Larkspur Yard $36.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID =0 Class 6 $16.80 / Class 5 $16.80
FOB: Vendors Plant $36.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SECTION TWO: SALT AND SAND MIX
10,000 tons (approximate) 50% salt/sand (squeegee)

Cost per Ton ~ FOB Castle Rock $175.00 $96.01 / ton + FSC NO BID NO BID $105.13 $101.00
Cost per Ton ~ FOB Parker $180.00 $96.06 / ton + FSC NO BID NO BID $105.13 $104.00
Cost per Ton ~ FOB Northwest Facility $180.00 $94.76 / ton + FSC NO BID NO BID $105.13 $104.00
Cost per Ton ~ FOB Larkspur Yard $180.00 $97.76 / ton + FSC NO BID NO BID $105.13 $98.00

Cost per Ton ~ FOB Southeast Facility $180.00 $98.16 / ton + FSC NO BID NO BID $105.13 $94.75
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ROAD MATERIAL PROVIDERS

AC CONCRETE & DENVER INDUSTRIAL SALES & GREEN DREAM SITEONE LANDSCAPE
BIDDERS MATERIALS BRANNAN SAND & GRAVEL CRAFCO, INC. SERVICE CO. INTERNATIONAL LLC HOLCIM SUPPLY
COMPANY CONTACT JUSTIN CLARE RACHEL HENDRICKSON GAIL GAUTIER TODD MELLEMA VARAND VARTANIAN NIC HARTMAN KEITH MCGINTY
COMPANY TELEPHONE NUMBER 719-748-3805 303-853-1231 602-276-0406 303-935-2485 814-840-1880 303-716-5200 216-706-9250
CONTACT EMAIL ADDRESS ACConcrete@USA.net rhendrickson@brannanl.com bids@crafco.com todd@dissco.net info@gdicompany.com nic.hartman@holcim.com bids@SiteOne.com
SECTION THREE: RIP RAP
2,800 tons (approximate) Rip Rap material
Type VL - Rip Rap (6") Cost per Ton
FOB: Castle Rock $52.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.55 $43.80 $54.95
FOB: Parker $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $61.69 $44.15 $54.95
FOB: Southeast Facility $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.27 $49.85 $58.00
FOB: Vendors Plant $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.03 $37.00 NO BID
FOB: Waterton Yard $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.34 $41.75 $51.85
FOB: Larkspur Yard $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.13 $47.60 $56.50
Type L - Rip Rap (9") Cost per Ton
FOB: Castle Rock $54.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.31 $46.80 $55.50
FOB: Parker $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.84 $47.15 $55.50
FOB: Southeast Facility $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.59 $52.85 $59.85
FOB: Vendors Plant $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.03 $40.00 NO BID
FOB: Waterton Yard $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.41 $44.75 $53.00
FOB: Larkspur Yard $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.15 $50.60 $58.10
Type H - Rip Rap (18") Cost per Ton
FOB: Castle Rock $71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.02 $49.80 $61.00
FOB: Parker $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.55 $50.15 $60.95
FOB: Southeast Facility $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $61.30 $55.85 $64.50
FOB: Vendors Plant $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.74 $43.00 NO BID
FOB: Waterton Yard $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.12 $47.75 $57.50
FOB: Larkspur Yard $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.86 $53.60 $62.50
Type VH - Rip Rap (24") Cost per Ton
FOB: Castle Rock $71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.54 $61.80 $79.75
FOB: Parker $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $81.07 $62.15 $79.75
FOB: Southeast Facility $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $81.82 $67.85 $83.25
FOB: Vendors Plant $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $66.12 $55.00 NO BID
FOB: Waterton Yard $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $80.64 $59.75 $76.35
FOB: Larkspur Yard $73.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.38 $65.60 $81.50
SECTION 4: CONCRETE GRADE 3/4"
WASHED ROCK
3,000 tons (approximate) Concrete Grade 3/4" Washed Rock
Cost per Ton ~ FOB Castle Rock $50.50 $44.60 + FSC NO BID NO BID $59.13 $33.90 $46.95
Cost per Ton ~ FOB Parker $52.00 $43.40 + FSC NO BID NO BID $58.27 $34.20 $46.95

Cost per Ton ~ FOB Waterton Yard $52.00 $44.00 + FSC NO BID NO BID $56.92 $32.10 $45.85
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AC CONCRETE &

BIDDERS MATERIALS
COMPANY CONTACT JUSTIN CLARE
COMPANY TELEPHONE NUMBER 719-748-3805
CONTACT EMAIL ADDRESS ACConcrete@USA.net

SECTION 5: CRACK SEALANT
180,000 1bs. (approximate) Crack Sealant

Cost per Lb. ~FOB Castle Rock NO BID
Cost per Lb. ~ FOB Parker NO BID
Cost per Lb. ~FOB Vendors Plant NO BID

SECTION 6: MASTIC
65,000 Ibs. (approximate) ""Pave Patch Black"

Cost per Lb. ~ FOB Castle Rock NO BID
Cost per Lb. ~ FOB Parker NO BID
Cost per Lb. ~ FOB Vendors Plant NO BID
Provided Three (3) References? Yes
Comments:

INVITATION FOR BID (IFB) #044-24
ROAD MATERIAL PROVIDERS

BRANNAN SAND & GRAVEL

RACHEL HENDRICKSON
303-853-1231
rhendrickson@brannanl.com

CRAFCO, INC.

GAIL GAUTIER
602-276-0406

bids@crafco.com

NO BID $0.60
NO BID $0.60
NO BID $0.60
NO BID $0.65
NO BID $0.65
NO BID $0.65
No Yes

* FOB Vendor Yard for Class 6
Base is Pit 14, 7281 Colorado
Blvd (all locations FOB Pit 14)

* Vendor Fuel Surcharge Terms:
There will be a 3% fuel surcharge
added if/when fuel reaches
$3.00/gallon. It will increase an
additional 4% for every $0.25
increase after $3.00/gallon. Diesel
prices are determined using the
US Energy Info Admin (EIA) as
the fuel price source for the Rocky
Mountain Region -
http://www.eia.gov/petroleum/gas
diesel

GREEN DREAM
INTERNATIONAL LLC
VARAND VARTANIAN
814-840-1880
info@gdicompany.com

DENVER INDUSTRIAL SALES &
SERVICE CO.
TODD MELLEMA
303-935-2485

todd@dissco.net

$0.59 NO BID
$0.59 NO BID
$0.59 NO BID
$0.61 NO BID
$0.61 NO BID
$0.61 NO BID
Yes Yes

* Terms are Net 30, Payment by
purchasing cards are an acceptable form of
payment.

* All delivered prices are quoted FOB
Parker in full truckload quantities of
44,100 Ib min. FOB Vendor Plant is
distributor location at 850 S Lipan St,
Denver, CO 80223

Sealants picked up at Vendor plant must be
in any full pallet quantities of 2,100 1b

HOLCIM

NIC HARTMAN
303-716-5200

nic.hartman@holcim.com

SITEONE LANDSCAPE
SUPPLY
KEITH MCGINTY
216-706-9250

bids@SiteOne.com

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Yes
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